
Geschakelde Woning te huur in Nueva Andalucía,
Marbella

2.800 - 2.800 €

Referentie: R5039797  Slaapkamers: 3  Badkamers: 3  Plotgrootte: 10m  Perceelgrootte: 140m  Terras: 20m2 2 2
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Costa del Sol, Nueva Andalucía

Charming three-bedroom townhouse located in the heart of Nueva Andalucía, one of Marbella's most sought-a3er
residen4al areas. This magnificent property is spread over three floors and has been designed to offer comfort,
func4onality, and a relaxed lifestyle. Upon entering the home, we find a spacious and bright west-facing living room,
allowing for abundant natural light throughout most of the day. From the living room, there is direct access to a
pleasant terrace with a private garden, ideal for relaxing outdoors, enjoying meals with friends, or simply contempla4ng
the sunsets. The main floor also features a separate kitchen, fully equipped with modern appliances and ample storage
space, ideal for cooking enthusiasts. On this same floor, there is a guest toilet, perfect for guests. Upstairs, we discover
two good-sized bedrooms, both with built-in wardrobes and large windows that allow for excellent ven4la4on. These
rooms share a full bathroom with a bathtub, tastefully decorated with quality materials. The top floor is dedicated to
the master bedroom, which enjoys greater privacy. This elegant bedroom features an en-suite bathroom, spacious
closets, and a tranquil atmosphere that makes it a true retreat within the home. The property is located just a 10-
minute drive from the pres4gious Puerto Banús, known for its marina, luxury bou4ques, restaurants, and nightlife.
Addi4onally, some of the most renowned golf courses on the Costa del Sol, such as Las Brisas, Aloha Golf, and Los
Naranjos, are just 5 minutes away, making this home an excellent choice for families and golf enthusiasts alike. Also
nearby is the popular La Campana area, where residents can enjoy a wide range of services, including supermarkets,
local shops, pharmacies, cafes, and restaurants serving interna4onal cuisine. Services and Common Areas The
community in which this townhouse is located is impeccably maintained, with clean common areas, easy access, and a
quiet and secure environment. The property includes a private parking space located right at the entrance of the home,
providing great convenience. This charming townhouse is an excellent opportunity for those looking for a well-located
family home in a quiet area with easy access to all the amenities and attractions Marbella has to offer.
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Kenmerken:
Extra's 
Overdekt terras 
Privé Terras 
Satelliet TV 
Ensuite badkamer 
Marmeren vloeren 
Inbouwkasten 
WiFi 

Zonorientatie 
West 

Klimaatbeheersing 
Airconditioning 
Koude A/C 
Warme A/C 
Open haard 

Uitzicht 
Garden Views 
Pool Bekeken 

Ligging 
Dichtbij golfbaan 
Dichtbij haven 
Urbanisatie 
Dichtbij zee 
Dicht bij winkels 
Dichtbij stad 
Dichtbij scholen 

Huidige Staat 
Uitstekende conditie 

Zwembad 
Gemeenschappelijk zwembad 

Meubilering 
Volledig gemeubileerd 

Keuken 
Volledig ingerichte keuken 

Tuin 
gemeenschappelijke tuin 

Beveiliging 
Omheind complex 

Parkeergelegenheid 
private Parking 
parkeren op straat 
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